From: Jon Frederick jfrederick@townofjaffrey.com
Subject: RE: United Rentals, Inc: Invoice# 209318696-001
Date: August 31, 2022 at 11:43 AM

To: Bradley Davis bdavisconstructionco@gmail.com, Renee Davis renee_d@davisconstructionco.net, Robert Stephenson
rob@rs41.org, Todd Croteau tcroteau@townofjaffrey.com

Thanks, Brad. Submitted for payment today. -Jon

From: Bradley Davis <bdavisconstructionco@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, August 31, 2022 11:37 AM

To: Jon Frederick <jfrederick@townofjaffrey.com>; Renee Davis
<renee_d@davisconstructionco.net>; Robert Stephenson <rob@rs41.org>; Todd Croteau
<tcroteau@townofjaffrey.com>

Subject: Fwd: United Rentals, Inc: Invoice# 209318696-001

Hi All

Please find invoice attached. We need to ensure the at payment is made referencing my account
number and invoice number so funds are approximately applied.

Thank you
Brad Davis
Davis Construction Co

UNITED RENTALS, INC.
Branch 802 MANCHES802
2 SUTTON CIRCLE
HOOKSETT NH 03106 US
603-622-1555

Bradley Davis Email sent via IPhone
Davis Construction Co Llc

Cell 603-630-0848

Office 603-924-4038


https://www.google.com/maps/search/2+SUTTON+CIRCLE+%0D%0AHOOKSETT+NH++03106+++++++US?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/2+SUTTON+CIRCLE+%0D%0AHOOKSETT+NH++03106+++++++US?entry=gmail&source=g

